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Anritsu Spectrum Analyzers are now compatible 
with Y.I.C. Technologies EMC Solutions. 

Anritsu’s pioneering history of developing reliable and dependable instruments for 
the world’s most demanding RF measurements in the toughest environments are 
now available for EMC Pre-Compliance testing using the market leading scanning 
solutions by Y.I.C. Technologies. 

Y.I.C. Technologies (www.yictechnologies.com), London, UK, Developer of EMC/EMI 
test and measurement solutions are introducing to the EMC/EMI Industry the newly 
added Spectrum Analyzers from Anritsu. 

These solutions assist Design Engineers to rapidly diagnose and solve EMC/EMI 
challenges. The EMC Certification process is costly and time consuming and with 
these pre-compliance solutions, it will give businesses the opportunity to minimise 
risk at this critical stage.  

“The EMC testing market is growing and one of the primary reasons for this growth is 
the increasing need for safety, so it is great to be part of this industry.  Adding Anritsu 
to our list of compatible spectrum analyzers is very important for the Anritsu family to 
be able to use high spec solutions for EMC Testing” says Yoram Shimoni, Managing 
Director of Y.I.C. Technologies.  

The EMC testing market offers services to ensure that the products adhere to quality, 
technical safety, and performing to regulatory standards. Testing is typically carried 
out in laboratories and manufacturing facilitates to improve the marketability of 
products and to lower the manufacturing costs in the pre-production phase.  

The EMC testing market is growing at a CAGR of 5.4% from USD 2.1 billion in 2019 
to USD 2.8 billion in 2024. Y.I.C. Technologies and Anritsu(www.anritsu.com), are 
excited to announce the formalization of a collaboration.  

“We are pleased to add Y.I.C. Technologies in our network of suppliers” said Sophie 
Barc, Anritsu's Sales Director ACUK. “They have long experience and high 
reputation in terms of customer, market and product knowledge and we are confident 
they will help our growth in the EMC market.” 

 

 



 
About Anritsu 
Anritsu Corporation (www.anritsu.com), a global provider of innovative 
communications test and measurement solutions for 125 years. Anritsu’s philosophy 
engages customers as true partners to help develop wireless, optical, microwave/RF, 
and digital solutions for R&D, manufacturing, installation, and maintenance 
applications, as well as multidimensional service assurance solutions for network 
monitoring and optimization. Anritsu also provides precision microwave/RF 
components, optical devices, and high-speed electrical devices for communication 
products and systems. The company develops advanced solutions for 5G, M2M, IoT, 
as well as other emerging and legacy wireline and wireless communication markets. 
With offices throughout the world, Anritsu has approximately 4,000 employees in 
over 90 countries. 

www.anritsu.com 

 

About Y.I.C. Technologies 

Y.I.C. Technologies is a world leading developer of FAST magnetic very-near-field 
measurement technologies and applications, providing real-time test solutions to 
antenna and PCB designers and verification engineers, without the need for a 
chamber. The EMScanner is a compact EMC and EMI diagnostic tool. YIC 
Technologies solutions dramatically increase designer productivity and substantially 
reduce time-to-market and project development costs. 

www.yictechnologies.com 

 

 


